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Business Name: Leo Digihub 

Customer Base: I'm a solo operator serving a handful of clients with digital marketing 
services. 

Loan Purpose: I'm seeking sponsorship to invest in: 

1. Upgrading my digital marketing tools and software. 

2. Creating targeted advertising campaigns to reach new clients. 

3. Developing my skills in SEO, social media, and content creation. 

Impact: This investment would enable me to: 

1. Deliver more effective digital marketing solutions to my clients. 

2. Increase my online presence and attract new clients. 



3. Improve my workflow efficiency. 

Income Generation: With the sponsorship, I anticipate: 

1. Acquiring 2-3 new clients within the next 3-6 months. 

2. Increasing my revenue by 15-20% through improved services and client retention. 

3. Expanding my service offerings to existing clients. 

Unique Selling Point: Leo Digihub offers personalized, results-driven digital marketing 
services. With the sponsorship, I'll further develop my expertise and technology, 
solidifying my position as a trusted partner for small businesses and entrepreneurs. 

 PROBLEM: 

In Zimbabwe's current economic climate, small entrepreneurs face significant 
challenges in accessing affordable digital marketing services. Large marketing 
companies often cater to bigger clients, leaving small businesses and entrepreneurs 
without the necessary resources to establish a strong online presence. With a growing 
number of entrepreneurs in the country, the need for cost-effective marketing solutions 
has become increasingly pressing. Many small businesses struggle to compete with 
larger companies, and the lack of job opportunities in the formal sector has led to a 
surge in entrepreneurship. However, without proper marketing, these small businesses 
often remain invisible to their target audience, hindering their growth and sustainability. 

Solution: 

 Leo Digihub aims to bridge this gap by providing affordable, personalized digital 
marketing services tailored to the needs of small entrepreneurs in Zimbabwe. Our 
solution includes: 

 



1. Customized Digital Marketing Packages: We offer flexible and affordable packages 
that cater to the specific needs and budgets of small businesses, ensuring they can 
access quality marketing services without breaking the bank. 

2. Local Market Expertise: Our deep understanding of the Zimbabwean market allows 
us to craft marketing strategies that resonate with local audiences, helping small 
businesses increase their visibility and reach their target customers effectively. 

3. Hands-on Approach: As a solo operator, I provide personalized attention to each 
client, ensuring that their unique needs are met and that they receive the support they 
need to grow their online presence. 

4. Skill Development: By investing in the latest digital marketing tools and techniques, 
we stay ahead of the curve and equip our clients with the knowledge and resources 
they need to succeed in the ever-evolving digital landscape. 

5. Community Building: Leo Digihub is committed to fostering a community of small 
entrepreneurs in Zimbabwe, providing a platform for them to connect, share ideas, and 
support one another in their business endeavors. 

 

By addressing the specific challenges faced by small entrepreneurs in Zimbabwe, Leo 
Digihub is poised to make a meaningful impact in the local business landscape, 
empowering small businesses to thrive and contribute to the country's economic growth.  

 

BUSINESS MISSION STATEMENT: 
 
"At Leo Digihub, our mission is to empower small businesses and entrepreneurs in 
Zimbabwe by providing affordable, results-driven digital marketing solutions that drive 
growth, visibility, and success. 

 



HOW LONG HAVE YOU BEEN IN BUSINESS? 

I'm a new entrepreneur and I’ve been building my business over the past couple of 
months.  

YOUR NET INCOME 

Revenue: $900 

Expenses: 

1. Business Registration and Licenses: $100 

2. Marketing Tools and Software: $100 

3. Internet and Utilities: $50 

4. Miscellaneous (office expenses, etc.): $150Total Expenses: $200 

Profit: $900 (Revenue) - $200 (Expenses) = $700 

 

As a solo operator, there's no salary expense. The profit of $700 represents the owner's 
income. 

SERVICE OR PRODUCT DELIVERABLE: 

1. Social Media Management: 

    - Create and schedule posts for Facebook, Twitter, Instagram, and LinkedIn 

    - Engage with followers and respond to comments 



    - Develop a social media strategy to increase followers and engagement 

2. Content Creation: 

    - Write and publish blog posts, articles, and website content 

    - Create social media content, including graphics and videos 

    - Develop a content calendar to ensure consistent content publication 

3. Search Engine Optimization (SEO): 

    - Conduct keyword research to optimize website content 

    - Optimize website structure and meta tags for search engines 

    - Develop link link-building strategy to improve website authority 

4. Digital Advertising: 

    - Create and manage Google Ads and social media ads 

    - Develop a targeting strategy to reach the ideal audience 

    - Monitor and optimize ad performance for better ROI 

5. Website Design and Development: 

    - Design and build websites using WordPress or other platforms 

    - Ensure the website is mobile-friendly and user-friendly 

    - Develop a website maintenance plan to keep the website up-to-date 



6. Analytics and Reporting: 

    - Track website analytics and social media metrics 

    - Provide regular reporting on website traffic, engagement, and conversion rates 

    - Develop insights and recommendations for improvement 

Best Customer : 

Small to Medium-Sized Business Owners/Entrepreneurs: 

- Industry: Local services (e.g., restaurants, salons), e-commerce, professional services 
(e.g., lawyers, doctors), etc. 

- Size: 1-20 employees 

- Location: Zimbabwe (or specific regions within Zimbabwe) 

- Goals: Increase online visibility, drive website traffic, generate leads, and boost sales 

- Pain Points: Limited online presence, lack of marketing expertise, limited budget 

- Values: Personalized service, flexibility, and measurable results  

WHY CUSTOMERS DO BUSINESS WITH YOU RATHER THAN WITH YOUR 
COMPETITORS: 

1. Personalized Service: You offer tailored digital marketing solutions that cater to each 
client's unique needs and goals. 

2. Local Expertise: Your understanding of the Zimbabwean market and local audience 
helps you develop effective marketing strategies that resonate with customers. 



3. Flexibility and Adaptability: As a solo operator, you can be more agile and responsive 
to client needs, adapting your services to meet their evolving requirements. 

4. Cost-Effective Solutions: You provide affordable digital marketing services that fit 
within clients' budgets, making you an attractive option for small businesses and 
entrepreneurs. 

5. Results-Driven Approach: You focus on delivering measurable results and ROI for 
your clients, ensuring they see tangible benefits from your services. 

6. Strong Communication: You maintain open and regular communication with clients, 
keeping them informed about progress and ensuring their needs are met. 

WHAT IS THE MOST COMMON CAUSE FOR A BUSINESS LIKE THIS TO 
FAIL?  

Some common causes for a digital marketing business like Leo Digihub to fail include: 

1. Lack of Client Acquisition: Insufficient marketing efforts or ineffective sales strategies 
can lead to a lack of clients, making it difficult to sustain the business. 

2. Intense Competition: The digital marketing industry is highly competitive, and failing 
to differentiate yourself or offer unique value can make it challenging to attract and 
retain clients. 

3. Inadequate Cash Flow Management: Poor financial planning, delayed payments, or 
irregular income can lead to cash flow problems, making it difficult to sustain the 
business. 

4. Failure to Adapt to Industry Changes: The digital marketing landscape is constantly 
evolving, and failing to stay up-to-date with the latest trends, tools, and best practices 
can make your services less relevant or effective. 

5. Poor Service Delivery: Failing to deliver high-quality services, meeting deadlines, or 
managing client expectations can damage your reputation and lead to a loss of clients. 



 
 
HOW CAN YOU AVOID THIS PROBLEM? 
 
1. Develop a solid business plan: Outline goals, target market, marketing strategies, 
financial projections, and growth plans. 

2. Stay up-to-date with industry trends: Continuously educate yourself on the latest 
digital marketing tools, techniques, and best practices. 

3. Diversify your services: Offer a range of services to cater to different client needs and 
reduce dependence on a single service. 

4. Build strong client relationships: Focus on delivering excellent customer service, 
communicating effectively, and meeting client expectations. 

5. Manage finances effectively: Monitor cash flow, set realistic pricing, and maintain a 
financial safety net. 

6. Develop a unique value proposition: Clearly define your niche, services, and benefits 
to differentiate yourself from competitors. 

7. Continuously evaluate and improve: Regularly assess your business performance, 
identify areas for improvement, and implement changes to stay competitive. 

LIST YOUR SERVICES OR PRODUCTS  AND THEIR PRICES: 

Digital Marketing Services: 

1. Social Media Management: 

    - Basic Package (1 platform): $150/month 

    - Premium Package (3 platforms): $300/month 



    - Enterprise Package (5 platforms): $500/month 

2. Content Creation: 

    - Blog Post (500 words): $50 

   - Social Media Post (Facebook, Twitter, Instagram): $20 

    - Video Scriptwriting: $100 

3. SEO Services: 

    - Basic SEO Audit: $100 

    - SEO Optimization (1 page): $50 

    - Ongoing SEO Services: $200/month 

4. Digital Advertising: 

    - Google Ads Campaign Setup: $150 

    - Social Media Ads Campaign Setup: $100 

    - Ongoing Ad Management: $200/month 

5. Website Design and Development: 

    - Basic Website Design: $500 

    - E-commerce Website Design: $1,500 

    - Website Maintenance: $50/month 



 

Packages: 

 

1. Starter Package: $300 (includes social media setup, content creation, and basic SEO 
audit) 

2. Growth Package: $600 (includes social media management, content creation, SEO 
optimization, and digital advertising) 

3. Enterprise Package: $1,200 (includes comprehensive digital marketing strategy,  

Social media management, content creation, SEO, and digital advertising) 

 

HOW DO CUSTOMERS KNOW THAT YOU EXIST?: 

 1. Website: Create a professional website showcasing your services, portfolio, and 
contact information. 

2. Social Media: Establish a presence on relevant platforms (e.g., Facebook, LinkedIn, 
Twitter) and post engaging content. 

3. Networking: Attend local events, conferences, and meetups to connect with potential 
clients and partners. 

4. Referrals: Encourage happy clients to refer your services to their network. 

5. Online Directories: List your business in online directories like Google My Business, 
Clutch, or GoodFirms. 



6. Content Marketing: Create valuable content (blog posts, videos, podcasts) to 
demonstrate your expertise and attract potential clients. 

7. Paid Advertising: Use targeted online ads (Google Ads, Facebook Ads) to reach your 
target audience. 

8. Partnerships: Collaborate with complementary businesses to expand your reach. 

9. Word-of-Mouth: Leverage testimonials and case studies from satisfied clients to build 
credibility. 

10. Local Listings: Claim and optimize your business listings on local directories and 
review sites  

 

WHY DID YOU CHOOSE THIS BUSINESS?  

 1. Growing demand: Digital marketing is a rapidly growing industry, with increasing 
demand for online services. 

2. Flexibility: Digital marketing can be done remotely, offering flexibility in work 
arrangements. 

3. Opportunity to help businesses: Digital marketing can help businesses reach new 
customers, increase brand awareness, and drive growth. 

4. Constant evolution: The digital landscape is constantly changing, making it an 
exciting and dynamic field to work in. 

5. Potential for scalability: Digital marketing businesses can scale quickly, offering 
opportunities for growth and expansion.  

 



LIST YOUR TOP WAYS TO FIND NEW CUSTOMERS: 

 1. Referrals: Encourage happy clients to refer your services to their network. 

2. Social Media: Leverage platforms like LinkedIn, Facebook, and Twitter to showcase 
your expertise and engage with potential clients. 

3. Content Marketing: Create valuable content (blog posts, videos, podcasts) to attract 
potential clients and demonstrate your expertise. 

4. Networking: Attend local events, conferences, and meetups to connect with potential 
clients and partners. 

5. Online Directories: List your business in online directories like Clutch, GoodFirms, or 
Google My Business. 

6. Paid Advertising: Use targeted online ads (Google Ads, Facebook Ads) to reach your 
target audience. 

7. Partnerships: Collaborate with complementary businesses to expand your reach. 

8. Email Marketing: Build an email list and send targeted campaigns to potential clients. 

9. SEO: Optimize your website for search engines to improve visibility and attract 
organic traffic. 

10. Word-of-Mouth: Leverage testimonials and case studies from satisfied clients to 
build credibility and attract new customers. 

 

Insert pictures of your business activities here and give a brief explanation 
of each: 



 

 

1. Social Media Management: Creating and 
scheduling posts, responding to comments, 
and analyzing engagement metrics to build 

a strong online presence for clients. 

 

 

2. Content Creation: Developing high-quality, 
engaging content (blog posts, videos, 
graphics) that resonates with target audiences 
and drives website traffic and conversions. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

3. SEO Optimization: Conducting keyword research, optimizing website structure and 
content, and building high-quality backlinks to improve search engine rankings and drive 
organic traffic 



 

HOW WILL YOU USE THE MONEY? (Include pictures of the product/service 
(s)  

1. Invest in marketing tools: Purchase software or platforms to help with social media 
management, email marketing, SEO, or analytics. 

2. Hire a team: Employ specialists in areas like content creation, graphic design, or web 
development to help deliver services to clients. 

3. Develop a product: Create and launch a digital product, such as an online course or 
e-book, to sell to customers. 

4. Run advertising campaigns: Use paid advertising channels like Google Ads or 
Facebook Ads to reach new customers and grow your business. 

5. Improve infrastructure: Invest in website development, hosting, or other infrastructure 
to support your business operations. 

Total Amount:$1000usd 

 

Income Statement:  



 

 

Cash Flow Statement:  

 

WHAT HAVE YOU DONE WITH THE PROFITS YOU MADE TWO MONTHS 
AGO AND LAST MONTH? 



1. Reinvested profits into marketing and advertising. 

2. Upgraded my website or digital tools. 

3. Hired freelancers or staff to help with the workload. 

5. Saved profits for future use or emergencies. 

 

 

Share about your family and picture here:  

 

 

 

 

 

 

I come from a family of four boys, and lm the last one and the only one not married Of 
my parents my mom is the only one still alive then my dad passed away 2019 and my 
first brother lesley has 4 sons, followed by livison who has 1 son and two daughters, 
then simba the third born has two sons and two daughters. We aren't that big, but a God 
fearing family raised on a good, decent Christian background. 

 



 

CONTACT DETAILS: 

Phone number: +263779394352 

Email:leofoundations100@gmail.com 
 

Course Facilitator Details 

Name:Chengeto Mubaiwa 

Phone:+263710433200 

Email:chengetomubaiwa@gmail.com 
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